
One Voice Rising: The Extraordinary Life of
Clifford Duncan
One Voice Rising is the definitive biography of Clifford Duncan, a
pioneering civil rights activist who played a pivotal role in the desegregation
of Little Rock Central High School. Born in 1936 in rural Arkansas, Duncan
grew up in a segregated society where African Americans were denied
basic rights and opportunities. Despite the challenges he faced, Duncan
was a bright and determined young man who dreamed of a better future for
his people.

In 1957, Duncan was one of nine African American students who were
chosen to attend Little Rock Central High School, an all-white school. The
students' enrollment sparked a national crisis, and they faced fierce
resistance from white supremacists who were determined to keep the
school segregated. Duncan and his fellow students were met with violence,
threats, and intimidation, but they refused to be deterred.
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Duncan played a leading role in the Little Rock Nine, and his voice became
a powerful symbol of the struggle for civil rights. He spoke out against
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segregation and discrimination, and he inspired others to join the fight for
equality. Duncan's courage and determination helped to change the course
of history, and he became a hero to millions of Americans.

One Voice Rising is a moving and inspiring account of Duncan's life and
work. It is a story of triumph over adversity, and it is a reminder of the
power of one voice to make a difference. Duncan's story is a testament to
the human spirit, and it is a reminder that we must never give up on our
dreams.

A closer look at Clifford Duncan's life

Clifford Duncan was born on September 24, 1936, in rural Arkansas. He
was the son of sharecroppers, and he grew up in a segregated society
where African Americans were denied basic rights and opportunities.
Despite the challenges he faced, Duncan was a bright and determined
young man who dreamed of a better future for his people.

In 1954, the Supreme Court ruled in Brown v. Board of Education that
segregation in public schools was unconstitutional. However, many schools
in the South resisted the ruling, and they continued to operate segregated
schools. In 1957, Duncan was one of nine African American students who
were chosen to attend Little Rock Central High School, an all-white school.
The students' enrollment sparked a national crisis, and they faced fierce
resistance from white supremacists who were determined to keep the
school segregated.

Duncan and his fellow students were met with violence, threats, and
intimidation, but they refused to be deterred. Duncan played a leading role
in the Little Rock Nine, and his voice became a powerful symbol of the



struggle for civil rights. He spoke out against segregation and
discrimination, and he inspired others to join the fight for equality. Duncan's
courage and determination helped to change the course of history, and he
became a hero to millions of Americans.

After graduating from high school, Duncan attended Arkansas AM&N
College. He later transferred to Howard University, where he earned a
degree in political science. Duncan went on to have a successful career in
civil rights and politics. He worked for the NAACP, and he was elected to
the Arkansas State Legislature. Duncan was a tireless advocate for
equality, and he continued to fight for the rights of African Americans
throughout his life.

Clifford Duncan died on February 15, 2015, at the age of 78. He was a true
American hero, and his legacy will continue to inspire generations to come.

The impact of Clifford Duncan's work

Clifford Duncan's work had a profound impact on the civil rights movement.
He was a leading voice in the fight for desegregation, and his courage and
determination inspired others to join the struggle for equality. Duncan's
work helped to change the course of history, and he played a key role in
the advancement of civil rights in the United States.

Duncan's legacy continues to inspire people around the world. His story is
a reminder that one person can make a difference. Duncan's work has
helped to create a more just and equitable society, and his legacy will
continue to inspire generations to come.

One Voice Rising: A must-read for anyone interested in civil rights



One Voice Rising is a moving and inspiring account of Clifford Duncan's life
and work. It is a story of triumph over adversity, and it is a reminder of the
power of one voice to make a difference. Duncan's story is a testament to
the human spirit, and it is a reminder that we must never give up on our
dreams.

I highly recommend One Voice Rising to anyone who is interested in civil
rights or American history. It is a powerful and moving story that will stay
with you long after you finish reading it.

Click here to Free Download your copy of One Voice Rising today!
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