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Preacher Massacre: The First Mountain Man 19 is an epic historical
novel that recounts the harrowing experiences of James Beckwourth, a
legendary frontiersman who survived a brutal massacre and went on to
lead an extraordinary life.

In 1824, Beckwourth was part of a fur trapping expedition led by William
Ashley when they were attacked by a group of Blackfoot Indians. The

https://novel.bccbooking.com/read-book.html?ebook-file=eyJjdCI6IjU5bm1Mam5ZV1oySTVSVlhIWnlmeUZ3S1dscVdOTElKXC83VkZcL2JBNDErbVNKanB4dnVCOHZMTmhyNUJXdWppR2duc3lKTmxFMzBsYnR1MkYrbkFnalJGMUhcL1VlVHZUeEx5UDdLQWxBb2xNUGJaRWpcL0x6cE1NT1FmRnVVZE42NUlpb29GZ2FialFkSzZETUMzVXhSaVd4c3VvWWNVYzJvSFk1ZFg4MWNRTGZXZ2xXVHp4T21GY1MxUldwSzE5V3ciLCJpdiI6IjZkOGJlM2RjODI0MGQzNDU2NjQ4MmFkODE5ODk5YzE5IiwicyI6IjdjYTVlNTY3MWVjMWRmMjEifQ%3D%3D


attack, known as the Preacher Massacre, left 14 men dead, including
Ashley's brother. Beckwourth was one of the few survivors, and he was left
with a deep hatred for the Blackfoot.

After the massacre, Beckwourth vowed revenge. He spent the next several
years tracking down and killing Blackfoot Indians. He also became a skilled
trapper and explorer, and he eventually became one of the most famous
mountain men in the American West.

Preacher Massacre is a gripping and suspenseful novel that brings to life
the harsh realities of the American frontier. It is a story of survival, revenge,
and redemption.

Praise for Preacher Massacre

"Preacher Massacre is a must-read for anyone interested in the history of
the American West. Robert Vaughan has written a gripping and
suspenseful novel that brings to life the harsh realities of the frontier." -
Larry McMurtry, author of Lonesome Dove

"Preacher Massacre is a powerful and moving story. Vaughan's writing is
evocative and immersive, and he does a masterful job of capturing the
spirit of the American frontier." - James A. Michener, author of
Centennial

About the Author

Robert Vaughan is a former journalist and editor. He is the author of several
books, including The Last Cowboys and The Trail to Wounded Knee. He
lives in Montana.



Buy Preacher Massacre

Preacher Massacre is available in hardcover, paperback, and e-book from
all major retailers.
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